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Precint 1 - Hwy 22 Corsicana

Coker & Son Havoc
Pilant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transportation T Bar D Trucking Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate 12.00 14.32 9.25 12.50 11.95
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Total Cost 17.50 19.82 14.75 18.00 17.45
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 13.10 14.97 13.00 14.00 18.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
Total Cost 22.10 23.97 22.00 23.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 13.10 14.97 13.00 14.00 18.00 |.
Dallas _  Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 8.50 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50
Total Cost T ) 22,60 2447 227507 ‘ 2350 27.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 6.60 2.39 6.50 10.00 6.00
Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix 65,00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Total Cost 71.60 67.39 71.50 75.00 71.00
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 9.11 NO BID 10.00 8.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flexbase A/1/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 8.00 17.11 8.00 18.00 16.75
Blg Creck Construction Hauling Rato NO BID 9.11 NO BID 10.00 8.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 22.00 23.00 7.50 17.50 16.25
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 8.11 NO BID 10.00 8.75
Groesbeck Materia! Rate - Type "C" Rock, Type "D" Rock, Grade 3 Coverstone 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
Total Cost 20.00 29.11 20.00 30.00 28,75
Cleveland Asphalt Hauling Rate 40.00 36.02 40.00 NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rate - Catonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 456.50 452.52 456.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 8.45 9.76 8.48 9.00 8.75
Groesheck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75
Total Cost 16.20 17.51 16.23 16.75 16.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 8.45 9.76 8.48 9.00 8.75
Groesbeck Materlal Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 15.95 17.26 15.98 16.50 16.25
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate 8.50 9.76 8.48 9.00 8.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - 2" Base Grade 1&2 & 247 A1 Grade 182 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 16.50 17.76 16.48 17.00 16.75
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate 6.00 542 6.00 10.00 8.75
Knife River - Sky High Material Rate - Flex Base Type Af1/2 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25
Total Cost 35.25 34.67 35.25 39.25 38.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 13.00 12,15 13.00 12.00 10.50
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Qil 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Total Cost 73.00 72.15 73.00 72.00 70.50




Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 13.00 12,15 13,00 12.00 10.50
Waco Material Rate - Hot Mix/Cold Laid ltem 334 D-Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Total Cost 78.00 2025 78.00 77.00 75.50
o .
VD Knife River Corp - South  Hauling Rate NO BID 9.11 NOBID 12.00 8.75
LY Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base Af2/2 8.25 8.28 8.25 8.25 8.25
~ Total Cost 8.25 20.25 825 20.25 17.00
[Martin Marietta Hauling Rate 6.10 2,39 6.50 5.00 6.00
Corsicana Rail Materfal Rate - State Base A/1/2 18.00 18.00 18.00 18,00 18.00
Total Cost 2440 — 2025 2450 ] 23.00 34.00
Martin Marletta Hauling Rate 6.10 2.39 6,50 5.00 6.00
Gorsicana Rail Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2 16.50 16.50 16,50 16.50 16.50
Total Cost 22,60 20.25 23.00 21.50 22.50
" |martin Marietta Hauling Rate 6.10 2.39 6.50 5.00 6.00
Corsicana Rail Material Rate - Type "C" Limestone & 3/8” Limestone 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00
Total Cost 29.10 25,29 29.50 28.00 29.00
Martin Marietta Hauling Rate 6,10 2,39 6.50 5.00 6.00
Corsicana Rall Material Rate - 1" Limestone 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
Total Cost 26.10 22.39 26.50 25.00 26.00
Mine Service Inc Hauling Rate 12,90 15.19 12.20 14.00 12.50
Waco Material Rate - Nontested Flex Base §.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
Tatal Cost 19.15 21.44 18.45 20.25 18.75
Mine Service Inc Hauling Rate 12.90 15.19 12,20 14,00 12.50
Waco Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Grave! Nontested . 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
Total Cost 2540 27.69 24,70 26.50 25.00
Mine Service Inc Hauling Rate 12,90 15.19 12.20 14.00 12.50
Waco Material Rate - D/ Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Gravel 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
Total Cost 24,40 26.69 23,70 25.50 24.00
Mine Service Inc Hauling Rate 12.90 15.19 12.20 14.00 12.50
Waco Material Rate - 3/8" Pea Gravel 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 20.90 23.19 20.20 22.00 20.50
Rattler Rock, Inc Hauling Rate 12.00 14.32 11.80 12.00 11.95
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base AM/2 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
Total Cost : 18.25 20.57 18.05 18.25 18.20
Rattler Rock, Inc Hauling Rate 12.00 14.32 11.80 12.00 11.95
Blum Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25
Total Cost 19.25 21.57 19.05 19.25 19.20
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 8.90 7.59 9.00 10.00 11.75
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Qil Sand 66.00 £66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00 §
Total Cost 74.90 73.59 75.00 76.00 77.75
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Auto
Liability

Auto Physical
Damage 3
a
-

225 2017 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDECEHR249223 $33,145 X X X
226 2017 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC9HR251208 $33,145 X X X
227 2017 |DODGE GRAND CARAVAN SE 2C4RDGBGSHR784515 $23,382 X X X
228 2016 OTHER LAMAR FLATBED TRAILER SRVH8262XGP039492 $4,950 X X X
229 2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC7GR327250 $29,230 X X X
231 2018 DODGE GRAND CARAVAN SE 2C4RDGBGBJR162057 $23,876 X X X
233 2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 3GCUKREC1JG297201 $34,614 X X X
234 2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC3JR313305 $65,944 X X X X
235 2018 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC1JR311794 $66,544 X X X X
236 2018 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDECS9JR312451 $65,944 X X X X
237 2018 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC7JR311878 $65,944 X X X X
241 2017 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDECOHR251290 $61,000 X X X X
242 2017 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDECOHR246396 $61,000 X X X X
243 2013 CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLC2E08DR341549 $61,000 X X X X
245 2019 | DODGE GRAND CARAVAN 2C4RDGBG2KR602678 $25,556 X X X X
251 2019 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDKCS5KR341984 $44,346 X X X X
252 2019 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC2KR346104 UNIT 2912 $65,000 X X X X
253 2019 | CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDECXKR347419 UNIT 2913 365,000 X X X X
254 2019 |CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC4KR246332 UNIT 2914 $65,000 X X X X
255 2007 |OTHER HAY VAN TRAILER UT 1H9GH36207KFF1197 $4,500 X X X
256 2002 |OTHER CARGO CRAFT TRAILER 4D6EB12132C003061 UNIT T5 $5,000 X X X
260 2010 |FORD F1i50 ' 1FTFWI1CVDAKAZ22480 $20,682 X X X
261 2019 |DODGE GRAND CARAVAN 2C4RDGBGBKRY80013 $29,268 X X X X
262 2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDECTLR275604 $39,970 X X X X
263 2020 |CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC7LR276018 $39,970 X X X X
264 2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNLCDEC4LR275408 $39,970 X X X X
270 2018 |DODGE RAM PU 3C63RRGLBJG352755 $39,000 X X X X
- : - R s e e 3Debartm3nt: Sh_e_ﬂfh S ey gt et e ot a2t < e rm e ,,'_rotaI:Number_of..Vehlcles:___ﬁ_d" :
35 2005 |FORD EXCURSION A 1FMNU4 1S65EC66243 $30,641 X X X
192 2005 |OTHER CARGO CRAFT TRAILER ADBEB16235C008378 $4,295 X X X
' L i ~ .. ¥1 . pepartment: Unassigned Department -~ - . " Total Number.of Vehicles: 2. —
-
Totals  Total Number of ©
Vehicles e
Auto Liabllity 168
Auto Physical Damage, Collision 150
Auto Physical Damage, Comprehensive 150
Texas Association of Counties Navarro County # 1750

Risk Management Pool

Coverage Number: R-CAS-1750-20210101-2
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Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix

Total Cost

8.50 7.59 9.00 10.00 11.75
81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
89.90 B8.59 90.00 91.00 92.75
8.90 7.59 9.00 10.00 11.75
83.00 83.00 83.00 §3.00 83.00
91.90 90.59 52,00 93.00 94.75
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Trucks In Fleet
Fleet (Unlimited) Fleet (5) Fleet (Uniimited) Fleet {(Uniimited) (Unlimited)
$85.00 Per Hr $75,00 Per Hr Dealivery Time: Delivery Time:
$7.00 per ton $6.00 per ton When Needed Open
Barn to Jobslle | Barn to Jobsite | Tammzx MinTVax
.18 per loaded .18 perloaded Dellvery Qty: Dolivery Qty:
ton per mlle ton per mile 12 minf2? max 13 min{25 max

$125.00 per load
from Bam to
project site.
Hourly Truck work
Is $80.00 per hour
within a 20-mlle
radius, 4-hr min
Any other hauling
that isn’t covered
by the rate sheet
(page 9} will be
figured at .20

par ton mile leaded

Limitatlons to
Delivery Schedule
None

Bobtail $75.00 br

Belly End Dump
$100.00 per hr
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Precinct 2 - Kerens

Coker & Son Havoc

Plant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transportation T Bar D Trucking Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate 13.90 18.23 13.95 16.00 13.75
Blum Material Rate - Flex Pase A Grade 1 & 2 5.50 5,50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Total Cost 19.40 23.73 19.45 21.50 19.25
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 14,55 1714 15.00 14.00 19.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00

Total Cost 23.55 26.14 24.00 23.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 14.55 17.14 15.00 14.00 19.00
Dallas _ . Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 9.50 9.50 9.50 8.50 9.50
Total Cost 24.05 26.64 24.50 23.50 28.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 6,60 412 6.50 10.00 7.00
Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Total Cost 71.60 69.12 71.50 76.00 72.00
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 11.07 NO BID 10.00 9.10
Groesbeck Material Rate - Fiexbase A/f1/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 8.00 19.07 8.00 18.00 17.10
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 11.07 NO BID 10.00 9.10
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 22.00 23.00 7.50 17.50 16,60
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 11.07 NO BID 40.00 9.10
Groesbeck Material Rate - Type "C" Rock, Type "D" Rock, Grade 3 Coverstone 2000 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
Total Cost 20.00 31.07 20.00 30.00 29.10
Cloveland Asphalt Hauling Rate 40.00 35.58 40,00 NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rate - Catonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 456.50 452.08 456.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 11.20 11.50 11.00 9.00 9.10
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 71.75 7.75 7.75
Total Cost 18.95 19.25 18.75 16.75 16.85
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 11.20 11.50 11.00 9.00 9,10
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 18.70 19.00 18.50 16.50 16.60
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate 11.10 11.50 11.20 9.00 9.10
Groesbeck Material Rate - 2" Base Grade 1&2 & 247 A1 Grade 1&2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 19.10 19,50 19.20 17.00 17.10
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate 5.00 1.54 5.00 9.00 9.10
Knife River - Sky High Material Rate - Flex Base Type A/1/2 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25
Total Cost 34.25 30.79 34.25 38.25 38.35
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 15.00 15.19 15.00 14.00 14,00
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Oil 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Total Cost 75.00 75.19 75.00 74.00 74.00
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Knife River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck

Martin Marietta
Caorsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Gorsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waceo

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix/Cold Laid item 334 D-Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

‘Hauling Rate
Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" A72/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Type "C" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 1" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Nontested Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Gravel Nontested
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3/8" Pea Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

15.00 15.19 15.00 14.00 14.00
65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
80.00 20.25 80.00 79.00 79.00
NO BID 11.07 NO BID 14.00 9,10
8,25 8.25 8.25 8.25 8,25
8.25 20.25 8.25 22.25 17.35
6.10 4,12 6.50 5.25 6.50
18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00
24.10 20.25 24,50 23.25 24,50
6.10 4,12 6.50-|- 5.25 6.50
16.50 18.50 16.50 16,50 16.50
22.60 20.25 23.00 21.75 23.00
6.10 4.12 6.50 5.25 6.50
23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00
29.10 27.12 20,50 28.25 29,50
6.10 4.12 6.50 5.25 6.50
20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
26.10 24.12 26,50 25.25 26.50
14.95 18.44 15.00 16.00 14,00
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
21.20 24.69 21.25 22.25 20.25
14.95 18.44 15.00 16.00 14.00
12.50 12.50 12.50 12,50 12.50
27.45 - 27.50 28.50 26.50
14.95 18.44 15.00 16.00 14.00
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
26.45 29.94 26.50 27.50 25.50
14.95 18.94 15.00 16.00 14.00
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
22.95 26.44 23.00 - 24.00 22.00
13.90 18.23 13.95 16.00 13.75
6,25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
20.15 24.48 20.20 22.25 20.00
13.90 18.23 13.95 16.00 13.7%
7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25
21.15 25.48 21.20 23.25 21.00
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radius, 4-hr min
Any other hauling
that Isn't covered
by the rate sheet
(page 9) will be
figured at .20

per ton mile loaded

Texas Bit Hauling Rate 7.00 3.69 6.80 9.00 9.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Qil Sand 66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00
Total Cost ' 73.00 69.69 72.80 75.00 75.00
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 7.00 3.69 6.80 9.00 9.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
Total Cost 88.00 84.69 87.80 90.00 90.00
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 7.00 3.69 6.80 9.00 9.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00 §3.00
Total Cost 90.00 86.69 89.80 92.00 92.00
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks In Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Fleet
Fleet (Unlimited) Fleet (5) Fleet {Unlimited) Fleel {Unlimitad} ({Unlimited)
$85.00 PerHr $75.00 Per Hr Delivery Time: Delivery Time:
$7.00 per ton $6.00 perton When Needed Open
Barn to Jobsite Bamn to Johsite Min/Max Min/Max
.18 per loaded .18 per loaded Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty:
ton per mile ton per mile 12 min/27 max, 13 miIn/25 max
$125.00 per load Limitations to
from Barn to Dalivery Schedule
project sita. None
Hourly Truck work Bobtall $75.00 hr
Is $80.00 per hour Belly End Dump
within a 20-mils %100.00 per hr




Precinct 3 - Richland

Coker & Son Havoc

'\q Plant Rates BM Logistics Teucking Transportation T Bar D Trucking Tommy Montgomery
. Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate NO BID 18.44 NO BID 13.00 13.75
“\ Blum Material Rate - Flax Base A Grade 1 & 2 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
~ Total Cost 5.50 23.04 5.50 18.50 19.25
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID 17.14 NO BID 15.00 18.25
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 8.00

Total Cost 9.00 26.14 9.00 24.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID 17.14 NO BID 15.00 19.25
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 9.50 5.50 9.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 9.50 - 26.64 9507 24.50 2875
Big Creek Gonstruction Hauling Rate NO BID 1.76 NO BID 6.50 7.50
Corsicana Malerial Rate - Hot Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Total Cost 65.00 66.76 §5.00 71.50 72.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 5.64 NO BiD 6.50 1.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flexbase A/1/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 8.00 13.64 B.00 14.50 15.75
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 5.64 NO BID 6.50 7.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base Af2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
y Total Cost 22.00 23.00 7.50 14.00 15.25
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 5.64 NO BID 6.50 7.75
Groesbeck Materfal Rate - Type "C" Rock, Type "D" Rock, Grade 3 Coverstone 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
Total Cost 20.00 25.64 20.00 26.50 27.75
Cleveland Asphalit Hauling Rate NO BID 32.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rate - Catonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 416.50 449,26 416.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID 6.08 NO BID 6.50 .15
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75
Total Cost 7.75 13.83 7.75 14.25 15.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID 6.08 NO BID 6.50 7.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 7.50 13.58 7.50 14.00 15.25
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate NO BID 6.08 NO BID 6.50 1.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - 2" Base Grade 1&2 & 247 A1 Grade 1&2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 8.00 14.08 8.00 14.50 15.75
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate NO BID 6.94 WO BID 10.00 .75
Knife River - Sky High Material Rate - Flex Base Type Afi/2 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25
Total Cost 29,25 36.19 29.25 39.25 37.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID 12.58 NO BID 14.00 14.00
Wacao Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Qil 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Total Cost 60.00 72.58 60.00 74.00 74.00
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Knife River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin.Marietta_— . _
Gorslicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Coarsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - Hot Mix/Cold Laid item 334 D-Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate - .

Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" Aji2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Type "C" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Materia! Rate - 1" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Nontested Fiex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Gravel Nontested
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Materia! Rate - 3/8" Pea Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand
Total Cost

NO BID 12.58 NO BID 14.00 14.00
65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
65.00 20.25 65.00 79.00 79.00

NO BID 5.64 NO BID 14.00 7.75

8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25
8.25 20.25 8.25 22.25 16.00

NO BID 217 NO BID 3.85 5.50
18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00
18.00 20.25 18.00 21.85 23.50

NO'BID 2.17 NOBID” 3.85 5.50
16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50
16.50 20.25 16.50 20.35 22.00

NO BID 2.17 NO BID 3.85 5.50
23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00
23.00 2517 23.00 26.85 28.50

NO BID 2.17 NO BID 3.85 5.50
20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
20.00 2217 20.00 23.85 25.50

NO BID 15.84 NO BID 15.00 14.00

6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
6.25 22,09 6.25 21.25 20.25

NO BID 15.84 NO BID 15.00 14.00
12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
12.50 - 12.50 27.50 26.50

NO BID 15.84 NOBID 15.00 14.00
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
11.50 27.34 11.50 26.50 25.50

NO BID 15.84 NO BID 15.00 14.00

8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
8.00 23.84 8.00 23.00 22.00
NOBID 18.44 NOBID 13.00 13.75
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
6.25 24.69 6.25 19.25 20.00
NO BID 18.44 NO BID 13.00 13.75
7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25
7.25 25.69 7.25 20.25 21,00

NO BID 5.11 NO BID 8.25 12.00
66.00 66.00 £6.00 66.00 66.00
66.00 75.11 66.00 74.25 78.00
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radius, 4-hrmin
Any other hauling
that Isn't covered
by the rate sheet
{page 9) will be
figured at .20

per ton mile loaded

Texas Bit Hauling Rate NOBID 9,11 NO BID 8.25 12,00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
Total Cost 81.00 90.11 81.00 89.25 93.00
Texas Bit Hauling Rate NO BID 5,11 NO BID 8.25 12,00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix 83.00 83.00 8§3.00 83.00 83.00
Total Cost 83.00 g2.11 83.00 91.25 95.00
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Flest
Fleet {Unlimlted) Fleet {5) Fleat (Unfimited) Fleet {Unlimlted) {Unlimited)
$65.00 Per Hr -l b ‘| $75.00 Per Hr- Delivery-Time: 1.Delivery Time:
$7.00 perton $6.00 perton When Needed Open
Bam to Jobsite Barn to Jobslte MiniMax Min/Max
.18 per loaded .18 per [oaded Dalivery Qty; Delivery Qty:
ton per mile ton per mile 12 minf27 max 13 minf25 max
$125.00 per load Limitations to
from Barn to Delivery Schedule
project site. None
Hourly Truck work Bobtall $75.00 hr
Is $80.00 per hour Belly End Dump
within a 20-mile $100,00 per hr
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Precinct 3 - Dawson

Coker & Son Havoc

Plant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transportation T Bar D Trucking Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate NO BID 12.80 NO BID 9.00 9.75
Blum Materal Rate - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Total Cost 5.50 18.30 5.50 ) 14.50 15.25
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID 17.58 NO BID 16.50 18.50
Dallas Materfal Rate - Waste 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00

Total Cost 9.00 26,58 9.00 25.50
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID 17.58 NO BID 16,50 18.50
Dallas o Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50
) ‘Total Cost 9.50- 27.08 --—-9:50- 26:00 28:00
Blg Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 5.86 NO BID 7.75 8.50
Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65,00
Total Cost 65.00 70.86 65.00 72,75 -73.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 7.16 NO BID 7.75 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flexbase A/M/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 8.00 15,16 a.00 15.75 16.00
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 7.16 NG BID 7.75 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 22.00 23,00 7.50 15.25 15.50
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 7.16 NO BID 71.758 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Type "C" Rock, Type "D" Rock, Grade 3 Coverstone 20.00 20.00 20,00 20.00 20.00
Total Cost 20.00 27.16 20,00 27.75 28.00
Cleveland Asphalt Hauling Rate NO BID 36.89 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rate - Catonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 416.50 453.39 416.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID 6.94 NO BID 7.49 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.756
Total Cost 7.75 14.69 7.75 15.24 15,75
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID 6.94 NO BID 7.49 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rale - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 7.50 14.44 7.50 14.99 15.50
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate NO BID 6.94 NO BID 7.49 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - 2" Base Grade 182 & 247 A1 Grade 182 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 8.00 14.94 8.00 15.49 16.00
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate NO BID 8.90 NO BID 11.00 8.00
Knife River - Sky High Material Rate - Flex Base Type A/1/2 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25 29,25
Total Cost 29.25 38.15 29.25 40.25 37.25
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID 7.81 NOBID 10.00 10.50
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Oil 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Total Cost 60.00 67.81 60.00 70.00 70.50
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Knife River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Gorsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Reck, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix/Cold Laid Item 334 D-Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base Af1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

" Hauling Rate

Material Rale -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Type "C" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 1" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Nontested Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Gravel Nontested
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3/8" Pea Gravel!
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base Af1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Cil Sand
Total Cost

NOBID 7.81 NO BID 10.00 10.50
65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
65.00 20.25 65.00 75.00 75.50

NO BID 7.16 NO BID 10.00 8.00

8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25
8.25 20.25 8.25 18.25 16.25

NOBID 5.86 NO BID 6.50 7.50
18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00
18.00 20.25 18.00 24.50 25.50

NOBID -5.86 ‘NO BID- —6:50 -7:50
16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50
16.50 20.25 16.50 23.00 24,00

NO BID 5.86 NOBID 6.50 7.50
23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00
23.00 28.86 23.00 29.50 30.50

NO BID 5.86 NO BID 6.50 7.50
20.00 | 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
20.00 25.86 20.00 26.50 27.50

NG BID 11.07 NO BID 13.00 10.50

6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
6.25 17.32 6.25 19.25 16.75

NO BID 11.07 NO BID 13.00 10.50
12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
12.50 - 12.50 25.50 23.00

NO BID 11.07 NOBID 13.00 10.50
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
11.50 22,57 11.50 24.50 22.00

NO BID 11.07 NO BID 13.00 10.50

8.00 a.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
8.00 19.07 8.00 21.00 18.50
NOBID 12.80 NO BID 9.00 9.75
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
6.25 19.05 6.25 15.25 16.00
NO BID 12.80 NO BID 9.00 9.75
7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25
7.25 20.05 7.25 16.25 17.00

NO BID 11.07 NO BID 9.25 13.25
66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00
66.00 77.07 66.00 75.25 79.25
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Texas Bit Hauling Rate NC BID 11.07 NO BID 9.25 13.25
Malakoff Material Rate - Mot Mix 81.00 §1.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
Total Cost 81.00 92.07 81.00 90.25 94.25
Texas Bit Hauling Rate NO BID 11.07 NO BID 9.25 18.25
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix 83.00 §3.00 83.00 83.00 83.00
Total Cost §3.00 94.07 83.00 92.25 96.25
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Trucks in Trucks In Trucks in Trucks in Fleet
Flaet (Unlimited) Floet (5) Flest {Unlimlted) | Fleet (Unlimited) {Unlimited)
_ --|.$85.00 Per.Hr. |- —— $76.00 PorHr -|-Delivery Time: -Delivery-Time:
$7.00 perton $6.00 per ton When Needed Opon
Barn to Johslte Barn to Jobsite MiniMax MiniMax
.18 per loaded 18 per loaded Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty:
ton per mile ton per mile 12 min/27 max 13 min/25 max
$125.00 per load Limitations to
from Bamn to Delivery Schedule
project site. None
Hourly Truck werk Bobtail $76.00 hr
1s $80,00 per hour Bally End Dump
within a 20-mlle $100.,00 per hr

radlus, 4-kr min
Any other hauling
that isn't covered
by the rate sheet
(page 9) will be
figured at .20

per ton mile loaded




Precinct 4 - Blooming Grove

Coker & Son Havoe

Plant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transportation T Bar D Trucking Tommy Montgomery
S~ [Amold Crushed Hauling Rate 9.55 11,93 9.25 8.05 9.75
@ Blum Malerial Rate - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
—_ Total Cost 15.05 17.43 14.75 14,45 15.25
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 12.55 13.89 13.00 18.00 18.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00

Total Cost 21.55 22.89 22.00 27.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 12,55 13.89 13.00 18.00 18.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Congrete 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50
Total Cost 2205 |77 2339 “22,60" ~ - 2750 2750
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 6.60 4.77 6.50 9.00 8.50
Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Total Cost 71.60 69.77 71.80 74.00 73.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 12.58 NO BID 9.00 9.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flexbase Af1/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 a.00
Total Cost 8.00 20.58 8.00 17.00 17.00
Big Creak Construction Haullng Rate NO BID 12.58 NO BID 9.00 9.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 22,00 23.00 7.50 16.50 16.50
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 12,58 NO BID 9.00 9.00
Groesbeck Material Rale - Type "C" Rock, Type "D" Rock, Grade 3 Coverstone 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20,00
Tatal Cost 20.00 32.58 20.00 29.00 29,00
Cleveland Asphalt Hauling Rate 40.00 38.41 40.00 NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rate - Catonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 456.50 454.91 456.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 8.49 10.42 8.40 8.30 9.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75
Total Cost 16.24 18.17 _ 16.15 16.05 16.75
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 8.49 10.42 8.40 8.30 9,00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base Aj2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 16.99 17.92 15.90 15.80 16.50
Helmcamp Materlals Hauling Rate 8.45 10.42 8.40 8.30 9.00
Groesback Material Rate - 2" Base Grade 182 & 247 A1 Grade 1&2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 16.45 18.42 16.40 16.30 17.00
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate 7.00 8.03 7.00 11.00 9,00
Knife River - Sky High Material Rale - Flex Base Type A/1/2 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25
Total Cost 36.25 37.28 36.25 40.25 38.25
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 13.00 11.50 13.00 11.00 12.50
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 OIl 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Total Cost 73.00 71.50 73.00 71.00 72.50
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Knife River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin-Marietta
Gorsicana Rall

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix/Cold Laid ltem 334 D-Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Fiex Base A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

‘Hauling Rate

Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" Aj2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Type "C" Limeslone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 1" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Nontested Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Gravel Nontested
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Grave!
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3/8" Pea Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Qil Sand
Total Cost

13.00 11.50 13.00 11.00 12,50
65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
78.00 20.25 78.00 76.00 77.50
NO BID 10.63 NO BID 11.00 9.00
8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25
B.25 20.25 8.25 19.25 17.25
6.10 4,77 6.50 5.68 7.75
18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00
24.10 20.25 24.50 23.68 25.75
.6.10.] - 4.77. 6.50_|. . 5.68 7.5
16.50 16.50 16.50 16,50 16.50
22.50 20.25 23.00 22.18 24,25
6.10 4.77 6.50 5.68 7.75
23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00
29,10 27.77 2950 [. 28.68 30,75
6.10 4.77 6.50 5.68 7.75
20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
26.10 2477 26.50 25.68 27.75
9.80 15.41 9.50 13.00 12.50
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
16.05 21.66 15,75 19.25 18.75
9.80 15.491 9.50 13.00 12.50
12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
22.30 27.91 22.00 25.50 25.00
9.80 15.41 9.50 13.00 12,50
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11,50
21.30 26.91 21.00 24.50 24.00
‘9.80 15.41 9.50 13.00 12.50
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
17.80 2341 17.50 21.00 20.50
9.55 11.93 9,25 8.95 9.75
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
15.80 18.18 15.50 15.20 16.00
9,55 11.93 9,25 8.95 9.75
7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25
16.80 19.18 16.50 16.20 17.00
9.80 9.98 9.50 12.00 12.50
66.00 £6.00 66.00 66.00 66.00
75.80 75.98 75.50 78.00 78.50
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Texas Bit Hauling Rate 9,80 9.98 9.50 12.00 12.50
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
Total Cost 50.80 90.98 90.50 93.00 93.50
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 9.80 9.98 9.50 12.00 12.50
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00
Total Cost 92,80 92.98 §2.50 95.00 95.50
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trutks in Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Fleet
Fleet {Unlimited) Fleet (5) Fleet (Unlimlted} | Fleet {Unlimited) {Uniimited)
J— -| $85.00 Per Hr~ .- - -] $75.00 Per Hr..- -—|.Delivery_Time: {-Delivery Time:
$7.00 perton $6.00 perton When Needed | Open
Barn to Jobsite Barn to Jobsite Min/Max Min/Max
.18 per loaded .18 per loaded Delivery Qty: Dellvery Qty:
ton per mile ton per mile 12 min/27 max 13 min/25 max
$125.00 per load Limitations to
from Barn to Delivery Schedule
project site. None
Houtly Truck work Bobtail $75.00 hr
is $B0.00 per hour Belly End Dump
withln a 20-mile $100.00 per hr

radius, 4-hir min
Any other hauling
that isn’t covered
by the rate sheat
(page 9) will be
figured at.20

per ton mile loaded




NAVARRO COUNTY

BID NO. 2021-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

COMPANY SUBMITTING BID FEDERAL ID NUMBER
LD " &2~ 16l 72l
ADDRESS
i (Ah
CITY, STATE, ZIP
K M <lT 5

AME AND TITLE OF INDIVIDUAL SUBMITTING BID

9028959928

b.mﬂan%swmau

FAX NO.

TELEP?ONE NO.

E-MAIL

7~/3-20z0

SIGNATURE OF AWHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

NUMBER OF TRUCKS IN FLEET ug\sm\“vﬂd

DATE

Hauling Rate Per Loaded Ton/Flat Rate Charge
Precincts) Delivery Time:
leltatlons on Delivery Schedule (if any); 3 ‘5‘0

from Plant/Barn to Site: (Including 'project sites within

Min/Max Delivery Quantlty j{tanftruck):

3E

HE Qﬁm-\o Abhéx\'(i / &.\R ner \(ndtd_-h\(\ ey nm\&

rﬂ_‘ﬂ,’i’lﬁ‘_— Dawson
Precinct1 | Precinct2 |“Precinct 3- _Precinct3 Precinct 4
s fam

Big City Crushgg ggngrete tlal!as, iES /

11143 Goadnlghl l.nne

(TypeAGrl&!) .

lWam Ceushed Cnn:reul

Blg Creek Constructign - g_qrsh:rl v (Hat Mix); 0D ln O ig-le).]
{Gedar Creek 1177 LCR 382, Groesbeck (Type AGY, BGL, €, D, Gr 3 Coverstane) |
i B N T Ao u.__.__._‘__ e e A A2y ey oo Lot sk il
{Cloveland Asphals - Shepherd, TX (Cationic Emulslan; Minlmurn 23 tonlsad) !
100 Asghalt Lane n &L g D
gcmners Cansteuction Co.- grggghggjz_ . mep.m&z) B R A i i b

U

862LCR 374 a0 g L\

Helmlzmg Ma;gr]ais Grueshgg k, e . !2' BaseGl&Z 2671\1 smz]
r[stmu Quarry, 478 CRI7S

A H_..._,__'_'. _'.:._.,...: w-_..‘-,-—-,....:.\

o

e {opee

1. 3
T T T e

nlfe Rivar rg - sgg]h
3423 War.n ™

3312 FM 1633 West, (Type AGr1g& 2]

e L gt

Man:ln Marlena - ggrsh:ana fall v

—cence

_ . 3/8" Umastone; 1" Umestone)
e T R A 2 T

{Nantested Flex Base; € Rock 374 Cruthad Gravel

R T R ,,,,....,,.,.. .,-. I L

Mlne s_grvlgg Ing, -Wacu,'ﬂ(

{D/F Blend 3/8" -1/2" :n.uhed gravel 3/3 peagravel] |

e A o e errra g B S S

aglgr Rggk, ln:.-glgm,Tx v

) {Flukun 3 Ny sueen:d rock]

e o Toemie—is dine o e
-..-.-.-———.-r e e e e et ot TN A e —

—-u— n«-ﬂ.""’_f-ﬂ'.‘-__.t.x;;_-»v«\-—n.u.. e Ty

e TN
M e

{2-Mix £4-22 Oif; Hot mlx/Cold Lald Item 334 D Mix)

{State Baze; Non Spec Base 5/8% Type € Umestone;

B B b 2 g T VD r-—-_Ln_-_ 3 R S D

I¥

v e e 4t

. m-mn—--f’-cﬂ-j
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Coker and Son Trucking, Inc.
2021 Navarro Co Bid

Aggregate Hauling

/i3

——
P

10615 CR 1220, Malakoff

S -11.07

Precinct 1: Precinct 2: C_I_’fégn_gts:’ Precinct 3: Precinct 4:
Price Per Ton-Freight Only Corsicana 4201 Kerens Richland Dawson Blooming Grove

W Hwy22 907 NW 2nd 700 S Austin i 17500 FM 709 104 E 2nd
gyl ;‘fokffo?: ne(Blum) s u32|$ 1823 § 18.44] ¢ 1280($ . 1193
Tﬁ:ﬁﬁﬁtgﬁfﬂniﬁl 3 14.974 3 17.14| § 17.14( % 17.58 13.89
zlzgsirn;ega?g::::: » 2.39 § 412| 3 1.76| $ 5.86 4.77
;::;l;rLg:;:Z, Grroesbeck ? 9.41 5 1107 5 5645 7.16 12.58
fl:z)e(;:?pl:'lill:slipdl:aslzepher ; $ 36.02| $ 35.58 § 32.76| % 36.89 38.41|
522'12557"?52?3223;1( > 9.76| 5 11.50| 3 6.08| 6.94 10.42
;’;gz?;ing?e::fck 3 9.76| 3 1150 5 6.08| $ 6.94 10.42

AOeSHECK

Ziﬂ)l;gﬂssaEngRg:lg;:‘,’T(lerens ? 542} 5 1.54| 5 6.94] 5 8.90 8.03
ggfgggeilré::.l:riggbeckl 3 9115 11.07| § 5645 '7,15 10.63
ggg: :Ai:::n Hwy 6, Waco 3 11931 5 14.97| $ 12.58 S 7.81 11.28
e O e
ngisyzasr:tézr::::na > 239] 3 412 % 2.17| % 5.86 a4.77
I:g;:':::nvif:;better, Waco 3 15194 3 18.44| 3 15.84| $ 11.07 1541
ﬁ:}t:; ?:Sl; Loop, Blum > 14.321 5 18.23] 3 18.44] 3 12.80 11.93
Texas Bit g 759 & 369| ¢ 011 .58




NAVARRO COUNTY

BID NO. 2021-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM
. At ' o\
COMPANY SUBMITTING BID \—\awoc \(cmﬁpof\fd‘\t)r\wﬂ 51
PO Box 51

4

1429

n. e
FEDERAL ID NUMBER

X3~ 12000

ADDRESS

Hlanmi

4
CITY, STATE, Z

Mo Dvarn

NAME AND TITLE OF INDIVIDUAL SUBMITTING BID

Q0> a91- 53,5

\v\\w*mmom’cd ionderen\itinall ea)

TELEPHONE NO. FAX NO.

VE-MAI L

ljo._\n()o Lc
_aliz f:m

ATURE OF SENT.

NUMBER OF TRUCKS INFLEET n\igniYedl

DATE

Hauling Rate Per Loaded Ton/Flat Rate Charge from Plant/Barn to Site:
Precincts) Delivery Time:;
erltathns on Delivery Schedule (if any):_ B '\5 oe¢ nouc/

(Including project sites within

MlnfMax Delivery Quantity (tonftruck):

it la f)F\’"Dﬂ ?nm’rDSc:\rb\*e.// A€ peg \oaded ¥n pé( ile,

| QRlchIand

__Dawson®}

- Precinct 1

Precinct;

2 | Pré€inct3 | Precinct3 .| Precinctd

{Type AGr1&2)

Arnold Crush Stnne Blum, 7
Big City Crushed Conerate-Dallas, TX

11143 Goodmght l.ane

Big Creek Construction - Corsicana (Hot M|x)

Cedar [reekll?ﬂ.tﬂaﬂz Graesbeck . (TvpeAGl BGI L‘ D Gr3 Cnuerstcne)

e T T e e

Cleveland Asphalt - Shepherd, TX
100 Asphalt hne

Helmecamp Matena!s Grnesheck, ird
Christmas Quar:y '475 CR37zg

Xnife Rivar Corp - South
3423 Waco, TX

[B-Mix £4-22 Dil; Hot mix/Cold Laid item 334 D Mix}

3312 FM 1633 West. [TypeAGr 1 & ZI

[State Base; Non Spec Base 5}'8 i Type C ljmestune

3/8“ leestnne 1" lees‘tune}

(Narltested Flex Base; CRack 3/4 Crushed Gravell

(o T o mm e e e

{D/F Blend 3/8" - 1[2" :n.lshzd gravel 3/8 pea grave])

ey




NAVARRO COUNTY
BID NO. 2021-H-008 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF A(
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

: /4,%/

3GREGATE

COMPANY SUBMITTING BID-—];BH'R-D —TRULCKING, LLC
5530 FM 033

FEDERAL ID NUMBER

Ao-2213%07

% 1llhz

CiTY, STATE, ZIP '
NAME AND TITLE OF INDIVIDUAL SUBMITTING BID

QOHETNEY
“TRAVIS OBNIEL. DWNER

254 - 5%: MLes5

TELEP FAX NO.

+baggﬂj¢r(1 a&mqla@md con

]

SIGNATURE OF-AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

NUMBER OF TRUcks IN FLEET UNLIMITED

* DATE

I
Hauling Rate Per Loaded Ton/Flat Rate Charge from Plant/Barn to Site: (Includlng project sites within
Precincts) Delivery Time: I HEN NEEDED  Min/Max Delivery Quantltw(tonltruck) (Ll l LW

Limitations on Delivery Schedule. (if any): Y\\DI\&E-

|

- | ;Ru:hland 1. Dawsond | .
Precinctl | Precinct 2! Precfnct 2 | Precinct3 | Precinct4
Arnold Grush Stone - Blum, X .. [TpeAGriay ] . n, OO 2 00 UhH

) 1loo Asphalt Lane

862 LCR 374

Héirricamp. Materials- Gi‘oe'sbe:k, TX

ClevelandAsghal Shegherd,TX

|Biz City Crushed Concrete-Dallas, TX
11143 Gnndnlghl Lane

Big Creek Construction - Corsicana
Cedar l:reek 1177 LCR 332 Gruesbe:k

Cunners Constructmn Ca Gruesheck‘rx

Syt e

Christmas o.uarm 478 CR374

Kmfe River Corp —South

3423 Waco ™
331?. FM 1633 West

(Hot Mlx)

{TvpeAGl&Z]

N.00 | 10.C0L
e DG e 1000 | 1000 | 1p. S0 | 1,775 | 4,00

[D-MIz 54-22 &if; Hot mix/Cold Lald [t=m 334 D Mix]

(TpeAGriaz)

(State Base; Han Spec Base 5]3 "; Type C Limestone;
3/8 Limestone, 1“ I.Ituutone]

[Nnntested Flax Base C Hn:k':ll4 Crushed Gravel]

IDIF E[enn‘ 3/8" -1[2" :rushed gravel 3/8 pea gravel]

3o = R K it o PR P M T e S T o e
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' '-.mn
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e



' COMPANY SUBMITTING BID

|42k

NAVARRO COUNTY
BID NO. 2021-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE
SPECIFICATIONS!BID PROPOSAL FORM

FEDERAL iD NUMBER

79-39704L35

@":;zgmz ﬂonﬁﬁg,ﬂﬁgg Sl qbgfﬁdt{
ADDRESS f

1000 _Fmse7 /éep/an 7X, 7678
mwmzm

/bforb J’gm{&/ & tone e
'A. ANDTI OF INDIVIL UM SUBMITTINGBID
S R7E5 —~ S/79 |
TELEPHONE NO. " FAX NO. E-MAIL
.G~/
SIGNAT OF AUTHO REPRE TATIVE DATE

N |
NUMBER OF TRUCKS IN FLEET V/A‘/me,%-(/

Hauling Rate Per Loaded Ton/Flat Rate Charge from Plant/Barn to Site: (Including project sites within

Precincts) Delivery Time:__ /)47 A—— Min/Max Delivery Quantity ‘tonstrucky: _/ ;4 25
Limitations on Delivery Schedule (if any): Hoan ¢ .

' éaé Tl Z 5 HeE ﬁc///c///é,qd' dyonis /0O spee 1

- ~ iy Richland _ _pﬂg'w';é?i’;ﬁ :
Precinct 1 | Precinct2, Prec]nct 3| Precinct3 Precinct 4
. .|Arnald Crush Stane - Blum, T {Type AGr1&2) ‘,q 5 i ya) 7 4 7

Big City Crushed Euncrete-Dallas,TK lwmé, Crushed Cﬁncrete) 28 N _A_,“ i je/ C-(j Y X7 g gz
11143 Geodnight Lane . ’ C?: ] LGP LA b
Big Creek Construction - Corsicana {Hot Mix); L0 Z-a2dll 7 52| &, s £ 50
Cedar Creek 1177 1CR 382, Groesbiack {Type AGI, BG1,C,D,Gr3 Coverstane) X Iy @ il F - ) ‘?, Pon Yol
Cleveland Asphalt - Shepherd, T¢ (Catlonlc Emulsion; Minimum 21 top load) . '
100 Asphalt Lana N 5 ] .
Conners Construgtion Co.- Grgesheck TX (Tyre AG1&32) 5/‘7 Y; i ~7, 7 g‘,@ Qg@
BE2LCR 374 i
Helmcarg Materials Groesheck, TX (2" Base G182; 247 A1 6122) 9176 |0 || 775 .20 | Q.00
Christmas Quarry, 478 CR374 . .
King Sand & Gravel - Knife River Sky High {TypeAGr1&2) 17 SO 7.7 00 | d.0C

|Knife River Carp - Sauth 1, ' / s |10 5O
3423 Waco, TX [D-Mix 64—2_2 Oil; Hot mix/Cold Laid item 334 D Mix) 0/‘5 0 / (7/0 00 /l/'c’ O
3812 FM 1633 West, {(Type AGr1&2} r TS [ e 7 S~ o) 10O
Martin Marielfa - Cursicana Rail [State Bas'e; Non Spec Base sls;';Typchmestnne; .@O » o ) -, 5_0 74- J'O 7.7 5—_

3/8° imestone; 17 Limestone) uO (@] r & O 5_| .S"O r "@ 7- 7
‘| Mine Service ne. - Waro, TX (Nontested Flex Base; C Rack 3/4 Crushed Gravel) /2. 5O ] 60 lel.orl/lp.aol 2.0
(D/E Blend 3/8"- 1/2* erushed gravet 3/2 pea gravei) L2l 00 ] <. 00 Oy &~ . O

Rattler Rock, fnc. - Blum, TX (Fleihase;a'-s's'c}ee_ned rock) f- ] <. 7 ., 76 Q . 7 . 7
Texas Bit - MalakofF, TX (01 Sand; Hat Mix; & Celd Mix) e 7 20 OO | 13.2677072.,50



